
RESOLUTION
i

N o. 1~
OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF NEVADA

RESOLUTION RATIFYING ORDINANCE NO.O1-2016 OF
THE TRUCKEE FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT ADOPTING
THE 2016 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE WITH AMENDMENTS
SPECIFIC TO LOCAL CLIMATIC, GEOGRAPHIC AND
TOPOGRAPHIC CONDITIONS

WHEREAS, the State of California revises its Building Standards Code on a triennial
basis, which includes revisions to the California Fire Code; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to Health &Safety Code Section 13869.7, et seq., a fire protection
district may adopt building standards relating to fire and panic safety that are more stringent than
those building standards adopted by the State Fire Marshall and contained in the California
Building Standards Code based on local climatic, geological, or topographical conditions; and

WHEREAS, an ordinance passed by a fire protection district to adopt more stringent
building standards relating to fire and panic safety must either be ratified, modified, or denied by
the legislative body in which the fire district is located; and

WHEREAS, a portion of the Truckee Fire Protection District ("District") is located within
the unincorporated area of Nevada County; and

WHEREAS, the District has adopted the 2016 California Fire Code with certain
amendments pursuant to District Ordinance No. 01-2016 (attached hereto); and

WHEREAS, the District's amendments to the 2016 California Fire Code are deemed more
stringent based on local climatic, geological, or topographical conditions as set forth in specific
findings adopted by the District in its Resolution No. 18-2016 (attached hereto); and

WHEREAS, the Nevada County Director of Building and the Nevada County Building
and Accessibility Standards Board of Appeals have reviewed and recommend the District's
amendments to the 2016 California Fire Code based on local climatic, geological and/or
topographical conditions within the District.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Nevada County Board of Supervisors:

1. Ratifies Truckee Fire Protection District Ordinance No. 01-2016 with amendments to
the 2016 California Fire Code, and delegates the enforcement of this Ordinance to the
Chief of the Truckee Fire Protection District, pursuant to Health &Safety Code
Section 13869.7(h)(1)(A).

2. Within 15 days of the adoption of this Resolution, a certified copy shall be transmitted
to the Truckee Fire Protection District, pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section
13869.7(c).

3. The Nevada County Community Development Agency shall file with the State
Department of Housing and Community Development a copy of this Resolution with
the attachments consisting of the Truckee Fire Protection District's Ordinance No. O 1-
2016, and the District's Findings set forth in District Resolution No. 18-2016, pursuant
to Health and Safety Code Section 12869.7(c).



PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of Nevada at a regular meeting of
said Board, held on the 10th day of January, 2017, by the following vote of said Board:

ATTEST:

JULIE PATTERSON HUNTER

Clerk of the Board of Supervisors

ur~C-i~

Ayes: Supervisors Heidi Hall, Edward Scofield, Dan Miller, Hanle
Weston and Richard Anderson.

Noes: None.

Absent: None.

Abstain: None.

VV ~
H nk Weston, Chair

1/10/2017 cc: Bldg*
AC
TFPD*



Before the Board of Directors of the

Truckee Fire Protection District of Nevada County

Ordinance 01- 201fi

An Ordinance of the Truckee Fire Protection District of Nevada County (hereafter at times "TFPD")
adopting the 2016 edition of the California Fire Code, as amended, regulating and governing the
safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and
use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in
the occupancy of buildings and premises in the Truckee Fire Protection District of Nevada County,
including that portion of the District in Placer County; providing for the issuance of permits and
collection of fees therefore; repealing Ordinance 01-2013 and all other ordinances and parts of the
ordinances in conflict therewith.

The Board of Directors of the Truckee Fire Protection District of Nevada County (TFPD) does ordain as
follows:

Section 1. That a certain document, three copies of which are on file in the Office of the Clerk of the
Truckee Fire Protection District of Nevada County, being marked and designed as the California Fire
Code, 2016 edition, including all Appendix Chapters (see California Fire Code Section 101.2.1, 2016
edition) as published by the International Code Council, be and hereby is amended and adopted as the
Fire Code of the Truckee Fire Protection District of Nevada County in the State of California, regulating
and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the
storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and devises, and from conditions
hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises as herein provided; providing
for the issuance of permits and collection and terms of said Fire Code on file in the office of the Truckee
Fire Protection District of Nevada County and hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if
fully set out in this Ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in
this Ordinance.

Section 2. That the following sections, which need certain information provided in order to be
completed, and hereby completed by inserting the fol{owing information:

Section 101.1. Insert: Truckee Fire Protection District of Nevada County

Section 109.4. Insert: Misdemeanor, 1,000, and 90; and

Section 111.4. Insert: 100 and 1,000 "for each day the violation continues unabated".

Section 3. That the geographic limits referred to in certain sections of the 2016_Colifornia Fire Code and
hereby established as follows:

Section 5704.2.9.6.1 Geographic limits in which the storage of Class I and Class II liquids and
above ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited:

Throughout all territory within the boundaries of the Truckee Fire Protection District of

Nevada County, including that portion of the District in Placer County.

Page 1 of 7



Truckee Fire Protection District
Ordinance 01-2016

Exception 1: Protected above ground storage tanks installed in accordance with Section

5704.2.9.7 and Chapters 23 and 57 of the Code and approval in advance in writing by
the Fire Chief or their designated representative.

Exception 2: The Chief may authorize the temporary (not to exceed 120 days) use of
above ground tanks installed in accordance with Chapter 22 and 34 of this Code not
exceeding 660 gallons of water individual capacity for storage of Class II and III liquids,
and the tank and manner of above ground storage is approved in advance in writing by
the Fire Chief or their designated representative.

Section 5706.2.4.4 Geographic limits in which the storage of Class I and Class II liquids in above
ground storage tanks is prohibited: is established as follows:

Throughout all territory within the boundaries of the Truckee Fire Protection District of
Nevada County, including that portion of the District in Placer County.

Exception 1: Protected above ground storage tanks installed in accordance with Section
5704.2.9.6 and Chapters 23 and 57 of the Code and approval in advance in writing by
the Fire Chief or their designated representative.

Exception 2: The Chief may authorize the temporary (not to exceed 120 days) use of

above ground tanks installed in accordance with Chapter 22 and 34 of this Code not
exceeding 660 gallons of water individual capacity for storage of Class II and III liquids,

and the tank and manner of above ground storage is approved in advance in writing by
the Fire Chief or their designated representative.

Exception 3: Home heating oil may be stored in approved above ground tanks if the tank
capacity does not exceed 550 water gallons and the tank and manner of above ground
storage is approved in advance in writing by the Fire Chief or their designated
representative.

Section 5806.2 Geographic limits in which the storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in
stationary containers is prohibited:

Throughout all territory within the boundaries of the Truckee Fire Protection District of

Nevada County, including that portion of the District in Placer County.

Exception: The storage of such fluids for use in commercial or industrial uses may be
approved in advance in writing by the Fire Chief or their designated representative.

Section 6104.2 Geographic limits in which the storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted for
the protection of heavily populated or congested areas: within heavily populated or congested
commercial areas within the boundaries of the Truckee Fire Protection District of Nevada
County, including that portion of the District in Placer County.

Page 2 of 7



Truckee Fire Protection District
Ordinance 01-2016

Section 4. The California Fire Code, 2016 Edition is amended and changed in the following respects:

A. Section 101.6 is added to read as follows:

"101.6 Headings. Headings are inserted for convenience of reference only and shall not be

utilized to define, limit or otherwise construe this code."

B. Section 109.4.2 is added to read as follows:

"109.4.2 Reduction of Penalty. The Fire Chief, in their sole discretion, may reduce any

violation from a misdemeanor set forth above to an infraction, punishable by a fine or not

more than $500.00"

C. The definition of "Fire Code Official" as set forth in Section 202 shall be amended to read as

follows:

"FIRE CODE OFFICIAL." The Fire Chief or designated authority charged with the

administration and enforcement of the Code or a duly authorized representative. The "Fire

Code Official" may also be known as the Fire Marshal.

D. Section 307.4.4 is added to read as follows:

307.4.4 Outdoor Open Flame Appliances, including permanently installed outdoor

fireplaces, fire pits, BBQ's, pizza ovens and any other open flame outdoor device that is

connected to a residential/commercial gas line service, at the discretion of the Fire Code

Official shall be installed with the following:

1. Gas shut-off valve located at stub out and readily accessible
2. Timer device to regulate maximum operating time to three (3) hours
3. Ten (10) feet vertical &horizontal clearance to all combustibles measured from the
center of the flame ring, not including the support structure. For devices per
manufacturers installation guidelines that have less of a combustible clearance may be
installed at the discretion of the Fire Official
4. 2"d gas shut-off valve accessible installed within 3'-5' of the device
5. Two (2) feet maximum flame height
6. All parts/assemblies to be UL or ASME listed
7. Provide product specification sheet for device design
8. Surface supporting device system shall be of an ignition resistance material (approved
by the California State Fire Marshal's office) extending minimum of two (2) feet around
device

E. Section 507.5 shall be amended to read as follows:

507.5 Fire Hydrant Systems. The location, number and type of fire hydrants connected to a
water supply capable of delivering the required fire flow to solely residential projects shall
be provided on the public street or on the site of the premises or both to be protected as
required and approved by the Fire Chief. See Appendix C. For any project other than solely
residential, the location, number and type of fire hydrants shall be determined by the Fire
Chief and shall be connected to a water supply capable of delivering the required fire flow

Page 3 of 7



Truckee Fire Protection District
Ordinance 01-2016

on the public street or on the side of the premises or both to be protected as required and
approved in writing by the Fire Chief or their designated representative.

F. Section 507.5.1 shall be amended to read as follows:

507.5.1 Where required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter constructed or
moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet from a hydrant on a fire
apparatus access road, as measured by any approved route around the exterior of the
facility or building, on site fire hydrants and mains shall be provided where required by the
Fire Code Official. There shall be no exceptions.

G. Section 605.3.2 is added to read as follows:

605.3.2 Main Electric Disconnect. When the main electrical disconnect is located on the
interior of a building, the installation of an electrical shunt trip shall be required on the
exterior in a location that is protected from the elements as approved in advanced in writing
by the Fire Code Official.

H. Section 605.3.3 is added to read as follows:

605.3.3 Auxiliary Power Generator, on any new structure or remodel that has electrical
power supplied by a secondary or auxiliary power unit with automatic startup and/or
automatic power transfer capabilities shall have an auxiliary power disconnect accessible to
Fire District Personnel. The auxiliary power disconnects switch/Shunt (Section 605.3.2 Main
Electric Disconnect Shunt) shall be located within three (3) feet of the main power
disconnect switch and identified with a permanently mounted, weather proof label marked
"AUXILIARY POWER DISCONNECT".

I. Section 903.2 shall be amended to read as follows:

903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler system in new buildings and
structures shall be provided in the locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12.
Notwithstanding any other provisions of this code, any occupancy other than R occupancies
(903.2.8) that have a total floor area exceeding 3,600 square feet, regardless of the
presence of any area separation walls shall besprinkled. Where additions increase the total
size of the buildings to 3,600 square feet or more, the addition and the existing
occupancy/building shall be provided with an automatic sprinkler system. Fire separation
areas shall not be used to reduce this requirement. The removal, demolition or repair of
more than 50% of floor space (not to include finishes, mechanical, electrical and plumbing
improvements) and 3,600 square feet or greater of an interior tenant improvement (TI) of a
commercial building, the existing occupancy and commercial structure shall be provided in
the locations described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12 with an automatic sprinkler
system. Any structure or occupancy that does not have maintained year-round road access
for all emergency response vehicles shall be sprinkled.

Page 4 of 7



Truckee Fire Protection District
Ordinance 01.-2016

Exceptions:
1. Whenever there are practical difficulties involved, the Fire Code Official shall have the

authority to grant modifications in individual cases provided the modifications do not
lessen the health, life and fire safety requirements as permitted in Section 104.8 of the
Fire Code.

J. Section 903.2.8 shall be amended to read as follows:

903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with 903.3 shall be
provided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area. Notwithstanding any other
provision of this code any R occupancy to include:

Additions: The addition increases the existing square footage by 50%and the addition is
2,000 square feet or greater.

Remodels, alterations and/or repairs to an existing California Fire Code regulated building
involving demolition, removal or repair of more than 50% of the gross square footage of the
building, the building shall meet the requirements for a newly constructed building. For
purpose of this Section, "50%" threshold shall be applied if the project involves any of the
following:

1. The removal, demolition or repair of more than 50% of the exterior weight bearing
walls; or

2. The removal, demolition or repair of more than 50% of the of the interior floor
square footage.

Exceptions:
1. Alterations or additions made solely for the purpose of complying with the

American's with Disabilities Act.
Whenever there are practical difficulties involved, the Fire Code Official shall have
the authority to grant modifications in individual cases provided the modifications
do not lessen the health, life and fire safety requirements as permitted in Section
104.8 of the Fire Code.

3. Additions or repairs for the purpose of seismic retrofit

K. Section 903.3.1.2 shall be amended to read as follows:

903.3.1.2 Sprinkler Systems. Where allowed in buildings of Group R, up to and including
four stories in height, automatic sprinkler systems shall be installed throughout the
structure.

Page 5 of 7



Truckee Fire Protection District
Ordinance 01-2016

L. Section 903.4.1 shall be amended to read as follows:

903.4.1 Monitoring. Alarm, supervisory and trouble signals shall be distinctly different and
shall be automatically transmitted to an approved supervising station, or, when approved in
advance in writing by the Fire Code Official, shall send an audible signal at a constantly
attended location and at such other locations as may be required by the Fire Code Official,

M. Section 6101.3 shall be amended to read as follows:

6101.3 Construction Documents. Where a single LP-gas container is more than 1,200 water
gallons in water capacity or the aggregate water capacity of LP-gas containers is more than
1,200 gallons, the installer shall submit construction documents for such installation.

N. Section 6101.3.1 is added to read as follows:

6101.3.1 Placer County Code. Placer County Building and Development Code Article 15.12 is
added as a standard for reference throughout the jurisdiction limits of TFPD for the
installation, maintenance and inspections of liquefied petroleum gas containers.

O. Section 6107.5 is added to read as follows:

6107.5 Protecting Appurtenances from the Elements. A protective cover shall be installed
over all gas meters, regulators, valves and equipment so to provide protection against
sliding, drifting and impact of snow and ice. The minimum design for the protective cover
shall be equal to, or greater than the Building Design Load (determined by the appropriate
building department) and shall be securely supported to the ground or diagonally to the
building wall.

Section 5. That Ordinance No. 01-2013 of the Truckee Fire Protection District of Nevada County, entitled
"An Ordinance of the Truckee Fire Protection District of Nevada County adopting the 2013 edition of
the California Fire Code, as amended, regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property
from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances,
materials and devises, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings
and premises in the Truckee Fire Protection District of Nevada County; providing for the issuance of
permits and collection of fees therefore; repealing Ordinance 01-2010 of the Truckee Fire Protection
District of Nevada County and all other ordinances and parts of the ordinances in conflict therewith,
other than Ordinance 1-96, adopted February 2, 1997 and Resolution 1-94, adopted January 11, 1994,
which shall remain in full force and effect is hereby repealed upon the effective date of this Ordinance
except that any enforcement or abatement action under that Ordinance shall remain and be pursued
until Resolution.

Section 6. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this Ordinance is, for any reason
held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this
Ordinance. The Board of Directors hereby declares that it would have passed this Ordinance, and each
section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections,
subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Page 6 of 7



Truckee Fire Protection District
Ordinance 01-2016

Section 7. That nothing in this Ordinance or in the California Fire Code 2016 Edition hereby adopted shall
be construed to affect any suit or proceeding pending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability
incurred, or any other cause or causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or Ordinance hereby
repealed as cited in Section 5 of this Ordinance; nor shall any just or legal right or remedy of any
character be lost, impaired or affected by this Ordinance.

Section 8.7hat the Administrative Officer of the Truckee Fire Protection District of Nevada County is
hereby ordered and directed to cause this Ordinance to be published and posted in compliance with
California Law.

Section 9. That this Ordinance and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and matters
established and adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full-force and effect from and after its
publishing, posting and approval as required by California Law.

Passed and Adopted at a duly held meeting of the Board of Directors of the Truckee Fire Protection
District of Nevada County on December 20, 2016 by the following vote:

YF1C` Noes:

Absent:

Abstain:

Att tecl key:

G"
1 ce L. Engler, Clerk of the o~rd

Dated: December 20, 2,016

Page 7 of 7

Gerald W. Herrick



b:

BEFORE THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE TRUCKEE

FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT OF NEVADA COUNTY

RESOLUTION 18-2016

In tf~e MAtter of:
Modifications to tiie 2016 Califoi•niR Fire Code.

A RESOLUTION ADDRESSING MODIFICATIONS
TO THE 2016 CALITORNTA FIRE CODE

WHERL;AS, the Truckee Fire Protection District of Nevada County (hereafter "TPPD" or "District') is a

fire protection diskrict orga~~ized and existing pursuant to Health and Safety Gode Sections 13800 et. seq., and

WHEREAS TFPD intends to adopt the California Fire Code, 2016 edition, and

Wi-I~RI;AS 'I'FYD believes that it is necessary to make certain changes, modifications and amendments

to the 2016 California Fire Code due to local climatic, geological or topographical conditions that exist within and

without the jurisdictional boundaries of TFPD, and

WHEREAS Health and Safety Code Sections 13869.7 and 17958.7 require certain findings to be made

with regard to those modifications,

NOW, TI IEIt~~'ORE, BE IT RESQLVED:

SECTION I, The following portions of the California Pire Code, 2016 edition (hereafter "Code") are

being modified for the reasons set forth below:

A.. Seci on i01,G is.addcc~ so to ic~e~Ytify th~k ~ea~~n~s are Ins~rtetI for ~on~~nie~ce and reference aril ;

and that tiic lzeatlings do not restrict the interpretation i t otifttrc~tYieti"t oft~i~ Code, This ~~lc#1t tin Is ii~cessary Clue`

~o Io~~l e)imatic, gcaingica# and tapagraphiaa~ conditions; by w~a"y aF ~~aitl~sle, heavy snowfall, hard free ,~,

urban i~at~rfKc;e with s gciiftcant wildland ~~ ~t~i,h~h winds: make it.n~;Gess~ry {i~ sp~cifcally identifj+ 2

district's fire prevention enforcement powers.

B. SEG1t0i1 101.4.2 IS AfI~Ed'SC}' f{# j7C01'l{~C fll~l .~}1C I`11'C`CI1tCf tltEty 1'C(~UCB`a tiitflAtlt3f7 ~Q ti ~.Il3~iitCktOit:

This aci~itic~ri is rae~essary bec~us~ tlie'o~l.cltnatic ~eologicai aad tapogrApiiic~7 canditicrns, in pkrti~ular, il~e

urban interface with sign ~ca~t wilc~tand'' fires an,'d high winds make it necessary tc~ ~iursue vivlai[ons as ~rnm~
tly

as possible so they can be abated or enforced when severe fire conditions exist.

L. Section l 11.4 is amended to provide that the violations set forth in that section constitute a new

v ~~ati~n. for eacta dA}% the vi~i~~tlbn cn~at~rsues: ~'hi~ atici~tit~n is necessary<b~cttuse tltc ~~c~t c~imatic.geplog caC

a~~ct to}~~~raptticai. condit~ans, in pa~Icula~, the urban nte~f~ce wit}r slgrf{~cant =w idled fires and high winds

n~~ke it ~rteccssAry to purstdc viol~tinns a~ ptom tl~?.~s possil~l~ so ,they can b~ ~t~~ted it er~forc~ci.whan:severe
 ire

conditions exist.

D. The definition of Pire Code Official in Section 202 is amended so to specify that the "Fire Co
de

UE~ci~d'"'tnay xlsa be knawr~ as tha "1~ir~ tNarshal." This addi#iap is xt~cessary for ease of reference s~i~d the ].Deal.

cr inatic getslo~ cal and topA~raphical' ~Qr~tlitions of this .areas re~~tire the ability to gtir ckly identify end

c~mtnur~ cate with the appropriate I~rc offi~i~ii.

~ec.Vi~f~ 307.~E.4 is added dui #4 t)~e proliferation of ot~ic~~or ~{ttnie' a~plianc~s in tt~~ area that c
ould

escaa~~ their enctc~sure or lie left ia~~at~ended and due to the local. climatic airtci topo~;raph'tcal con~3itians
 And urban

wiltiluntl ii~lerFace; ~ ~ir~ i Auld s~a~•e~d rabidly:

Page 1 of 3



Truckee rr~ Pr~tecGion District
Resolution 1$-2016

F. Sectioir 507.5 is amended so to allow for a determination of the location number and type of fire

hydrants to solely residential projects. Tha local climatic conditions oP-cold weather and heavy snowfal4 can

hinder the access to fire hydrants and the ability of the 'I'~'PD to attack fires.

G. Section. 507.5.] regarding fire hydrant systems, is amended so to reduce the distance of a facility or

building from a fire hydrant. The local climatic conditions of cold weather and heavy snowfall can hinder the

access to fire'l~ydrants and the ability of the TFPD to attack fires.

H, Section. 605.3,2 is added to require the installation of an electrical shunt trip if the main electrical

disconnect is located on the interior of a building. This is added due to local climatic and topo6raphcal

conditions, And, in particular, tha heavy snowfall attd snow accumulations during the winter months require the

appro~~t~~ installation of an electrical'shunt trip to be lcuted on the exterior of the buildinb so that the electrical

~t~wer;to a structure can be easily accessed in the event nt'a fire.

I. Section ,x;;;33 is added duc to the proliferation of attx~2ary power get~er~rtors in the District

would constitute a s ~~+~-hazarii;it~f~ters. Due to the local cl~ittatic :cad fc~~c~br<~ptt xconditians resultir~

d̀ ~~p: acccinitilati~ns of snow Ott the need to access and attack fires as,pr+~ni~~tly ~5 }}ossible, firefighters may not

} Y~ the'tiit~~ or ability to ins ,~;tlie entire premises for an auxiliary+ por~+er ge.~ie~•atoc:

. , -,. .,
~; Sec(ioit ~~13.~ re~grcitng ~st[tll~tian ai' spriitkters #ii ̀ eertlin ~tr~~cttire's iy e~ duc 'tp "lvc~j

r~»~~c q~~lc~~;ical end to~~ogr~ghict~fi ct~nditions. In particular•, during hard 1"rceTin~; or li~~li sti~vvf'~4I co~►diti~c~,;
~ 'sci the steep ra~+ds in the district, accessibility to a fire may he sowed qr iii~possil~lc. Due to tlae l tl`'~Tiit~atii~.
~~o}off ic;~l -end Eo~u~~;ra}~t~icH) co~lditiq~as tt~ax may exist., thereby slowing or ~revct~tin}; r~s~~Qtlsc t~fi a ~~ii•~, t~~~
presence U~~~p~`inkiers t~tz~.y ~ the only nzearis ~uailablc to suppress or slow the spread of a fre.

K. Section 903.2.8 is amended regarding tl~e iiee~i Cyr a~vmatie s}~ri tk{er sy~ti~i;s in ccrtaiii r~nis~dcted
~)tcred', rcpaireci nr a~iciitions to stet clizres clue tip local cl mi~tl~ olpgical ~~id topc~~ra}~hicn! concfit't~ns, 'taz
~Sarticu1a~•, dur~in~ lt~ird 'frcczinb nr high sn~v~ft~l{ cot~dit3otts,~#}ps~~=~teep~ro:tds 3n 19te district, accessibility fa
fire. may he slnwc<! r~r impossible. Uuc to the !Dell cf-i~maiip, g~~~~;icul and it~p~graphical con~iitiotas that nay
exist, tllercGy stc3~~rir~b ~r prwventiti~ respon~~>. tc~ ~ grey tfle presence of sp~•inkl~rs may tic tine only mcd~rs ~~vailRble
ro suppress or slow the spread of a fire.

t,. S~cfiq~i 9,43.3.I,~ ~~'ebartli~~ sprinkler syst~itts in ~,rgii}~ It <>cctipzricies ~~a to ~ir~d iiiclucli~~~; 4'our (4)

stt,~~'ics its Ileigla'i~. i5 ~r~~cndet~ dui to tY~a ~l~ard t~reezin~; ~~nd high snow f~i11 c:on~itiorts its wall as~~~re steeF>-ruzds i~
the T)istr~ict, acccssibiliiy to a fi~~e an~)~ be slowed or impossible. Ue~e to Thy .~ocaC' ciiiij~riic, gcc~#~gicai anc!
to>~}u~;raE~hic~~-~ cr~~nditions that exist, tt~erc:by s~lo~vin~; o~ pri:vt.tliin~.res~~~alse fps~~~tre,, ;tll~; ;~rese~icc o~ sprinl~ters
~~a~iy lie ll~~ e>tr1,y means uvailat~lc icy su~pr•ess tfr slaw tltc~"spread of a fre.

M. Section 903.4.1 is amended so to require an audible automatically transmitted alarm to be in such
locahons''t~s regt~irecl by t1~e ('it•~ ~;c~cie Uf(ical. 'I'hesc el~an~es arc •ec~iiireti c~tie to !~c<~! cli~i~~tic, ~ec~ingic~l.;flnti
to~~o~r~i{~(~ic~~I con~ifioits; rn par#i.~c.u3ar,zi~i~ri'ng ~~erio~ls ofliard frc~zin~ or Iti~;l~ stlowf~'(l, ~mii tl~e stee~~ roads in #tae
district. i1~e ,~,ceessib~lity nay lie sl4t,~':o~• iin~~ssiblc. Due t« the f~~ssif~te aGsc:ne~: c51~ ~r dc~ayecl t~es~aoi~s'~'to ~# ~
fire, it is necessary to ensure that all occupants of a str~t~#~~3~e are given prc~~>cr ,i~id ade~u~itc nc~ii of a fire sc~ z~
provide as much timeas possible to extricate themselves from that structure.

N. ~e~fi~n bt't~ l '~ Is aiy~cittier3 so t~ reiitice tl~ic #rig~;Grin~; ~,3~o~int for the staragc ;~I' [.I' g,~s ec~ntainers
r~;t}~iirin~; siibr aissiznl~t`c~nstruatiou d~actu~iea~ts.. 'Fk~is ~~n~ridr~teZ~1 ~s nec.ess~ry due try ~f~c 1~~;,nvy ~i~sawfa~l and the.
sl~~~~ir~b t~Pogra~l~ic ccitict tinny, local clin~aiic, and geptc~gical cnt~ditia~is ire this area, in p~~rti~:ular, il~e urban
interface ~vitl~ si~;~aifictmt wilei)~iid fires anc3 l i ii wi 7~is anake; it necessary tcj !lave a{~}~r•o~~ri~~t~ c;c~~istruction
d~~cument~ s~ib~~aiticd t~ ei~surc tl~c proper stora~~=c~fLP has containers.

Pale 2 of 3



'Truckee Pirc Protection District

Resolution 18-2016

O. Section 6I01.3.i is added to provide a standard reference to the Placer County Building and

Development Code Article 15.12. This amendment is necessary due to the heavy snowfall and the sloping

topogrxphtc cc►r~c1r11oas local climatic, and geota~cal conditions in this area, in particular, the slow movement of
accumiil~tied sct~lw that can result in stress ur Y~tpiuring of LPG containers and piping. This reference to that Code
will assist the District and those installing; LPG containers to construct and install them in the safest manner
possible.

P. Sectt~n 6107.5 is ~ddeti to provide ~t3e3tional, rt~gt~ired protection ft~~' #lte meters, reguTat~rs, valves
and equipment t~f LPQ containers. This amendment is nec,~ssary due to the heavy' snowfall, high winds and
freeing conditions experienced during the winter months and will help protect these J.~PG appui~tenar►ces from
cracking, leaking anti breaking.

SECTION II. 7'he Board of Directors of the Truckee of Firs Protection District finds that the
amendments described above are reasonably necessary due to the findings set forth above.

SECTION 11I. 'Phis Resolution is being adopted in order that TFPD may comply with the necessary

r~~iiirentErits-and pr~aceciiares i~ Otte»ti therCa~c ~u be adopted, in nartioulttt, Section 1795$c~ of the<~i~fth and
Safety Cadc. Adopiivri ofth~ C~tia wilt not mpv~:~~ntil public hearing and camrne~it, includ~n~;"but not limited to
tiny wrilten ar Verbal cotn~~+erifs by the Town ofTr[rclic~ County of Nevada, or County of Placer.

SEC'1'[ON IV. In order to proceed with the consideration and possible adoption of the Ordinance
amending and adapting this Cp~e, the I3~at'cl of Directors ~f T 'PD hereby authorizes tie District Staff to prepare
and publish a summary, of the flrdinance~puxsuant to Government Cpde Section,251,24(l)(l).

S~~'I'IC1N V If any provision of tFs Resolut€di ~r application t~ any person or circumstar~cc~s are ~et~3
invalid nr unegfarce~t~le, the rt ntttinder of the Resolution<$n~i the appl t~ti~n of such provisions to other per~dt~s
or circumstances shall not be affected thereby.

PASSED AND ADOPTED Uy the Board of Directors of the Truckee Fire Protection District of

Nevada County, on Se~ten~,~cr 2t~, 2016 by the following vote;

AYES:
V'.i c

Roh"~i1.c3 '~. Pe~ea ..

NQl>S:

~.BseN~r;:

ABSTAIN;

AT"1'FSTED BY:
c I,.`~~~~Iti~~•, t~c3►~~i~ti~tfiative OfFccr

DA"I~E1~?: ;~~>t~i~t(~et=2{)L ZU1fi:

Page 3 of 3


