Bid Number:

Title:
Project Number:

127248

Nevada County Roof Restoration and Replacement Project for Various Locations 2020

2:30 pm Monday, May 11, 2020

COUNTY OF NEVADA
NEVADA CITY, CA
BID OPENING RECORD

Buyer: Desivee Belding

Phone:

Recorder: Pat Schoellerman

Bid Date:
Witnesses: O  See attached Attendance Sheet O NONE
VENDOR NAME LocaTIoN | bocation Grass | g poise | NC Courthouse | Madelyn Helling |- Truckee Gov. Bid Alt 1 ADDENDUM 1 | ADDENDUM2|  BID BOND
Valley Library Library Center

1 Y:z‘terpmc’f'"g Assocates || i cA 58,000.00 no bid 358,000.00 98,500.00 146,850.00 no bid Yes Yes Yes

2 |D7 Roofing Services, Inc EaA”ChO Cordova, 1, 678.00 no bid no bid no bid 255,728.00 no bid Yes Yes Yes

3 |Johnston Roofing, Inc Martinez, CA no bid no bid 330,630.00 no bid no bid no bid Yes Yes Yes

4 |Madsen Roofing and Sacramento, CA  |44,575.00 no bid 357,956.00 95,331.00 no bid no bid Yes Yes Yes
Waterproofing Inc

5 |RSMRuaand Son Rocklin, CA 29,800.00 199,800.00 388,500.00 85,600.00 129,465.00 8.50 Yes Yes Yes
Mechanical

6 |Extreme Roofing Grass Valley, CA no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

7 [Brazos Urethane Inc Madera, CA 83,761.00 no bid 458,129.00 119,700.00 213,300.00 no bid Yes Yes Yes

8 |Universal Coatings, Inc Fresno, CA 40,900.00 no bid 367,950.00 130,400.00 196,800.00 no bid Yes Yes Yes

9

10

11

12

The above information represents the initial reading of the bids that were received. All bids are subject to review for mathematical accuracy and compliance with specifications, terms, and conditions. Award of this bid will be based on the verified results, not the the information displayed here.
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